
Prayers for the Month March 2024

Jesus, we join Bible Club member Myra in 
prayer for her mom, Daneen, to be healed 
from tuberculosis.

SATURDAY2

Holy Spirit, we ask you to deliver Bible 
Club member Kaai from his addiction to 
chewing tobacco.

THURSDAY7

Lord, we ask you to heal Bible Club 
member Rafif, who often falls sick with a 
fever and cough.

TUESDAY12

Yahweh, bring healing to Bahiya, the 
grandma of a Bible Club member, who fell 
and fractured her rib.

SUNDAY3

Lord, we ask you to bless Sarah, Mission 
India’s graphic designer, with creativity 
and wisdom in her work.

FRIDAY8

God, we praise you that Supranya is 
earning more income thanks to the training 
she received through an Adult Literacy 
Class!

WEDNESDAY13

God, we praise you for using Bible Club 
member Rupin to lead his parents to 
salvation.

MONDAY4

God, we praise you that Sahana became 
compassionate and obedient through the 
impact of a Children’s Bible Club.

SATURDAY9

Jesus, we join Church Planter Ambara in 
asking you to heal 2-year-old Aarav, who 
burned his hand in an accident.

THURSDAY14

Jesus, protect and provide for Adult 
Literacy student Gamila, whose mother-
in-law is abusing her for struggling with 
infertility.

TUESDAY5

Jesus, deliver Adult Literacy student Ladu 
from evil spirits and lead him to faith in 
you.

SUNDAY10

God, we join Bible Club member Prisha 
in prayer for her mother, Sneha, who is 
suffering from joint pain.

FRIDAY15

Lord, we pray for Bible Club member 
Alak’s sister, Nabeesa, who is suffering 
from diabetes.

FRIDAY1

Lord, we pray for the Gospel to spread in 
Madhya Pradesh, a state where 94% of 
people groups are unreached.

WEDNESDAY6

Holy Spirit, we join Church Planter Mahira 
in prayer for Panna, who is interested in the 
Gospel.

MONDAY11



Heavenly Father, we praise you for the 
salvation of Bible Club member Vinaybir 
and his whole family!

SUNDAY17

Jesus, heal 8-year-old Bible Club member 
Birva from sickle cell anemia. May she find 
strength in you.

FRIDAY22

Almighty God, restore Adult Literacy 
student Hareem’s right kidney so that it 
functions properly again.

MONDAY18

Heavenly Father, we pray you will change 
hearts in Telangana, a state in India that is 
only 1.2% Christian.

SATURDAY23

Holy Spirit, deliver Bible Club member 
Saloni’s father, Manan, from his drug 
addiction and lead him to a stable job.

TUESDAY19

Almighty God, we join Church Planter 
Anjish in praying that Bahurja will boldly 
share her faith.

SUNDAY24

Father, we ask you to bless Erik with 
wisdom in his role serving Mission India’s 
Information Technology (IT) needs.

WEDNESDAY20

Jesus, give miraculous healing to Adult 
Literacy students Shirina and Vedi, who are 
both paralyzed.

MONDAY25

Yahweh, give courage and perseverance 
to Jaza, Church Planter Bansari’s relative, as 
he faces opposition for sharing the Gospel.

SATURDAY16

God, thank you for leading Janya to Christ 
through Church Planter Dhaval! May her 
testimony draw others to you. 

THURSDAY21

“Praise be to God, who has not rejected my prayer or withheld his love from me!”
Psalm 66:20

Heavenly Father, heal 7-year-old Bible Club 
member Tajim from gallbladder stones.

TUESDAY26

God, we join Church Planter Jay in praising 
you for the salvation of brothers Sapan and 
Gihan.

WEDNESDAY27

Holy Spirit, bring peace to Bible Club 
member Anushka’s family. End the arguing 
in her home.

THURSDAY28

Lord, heal Adult Literacy teacher Anuprit’s 
son, Azan, from epilepsy.

FRIDAY29

Jesus, thank you for leading Kiran to Church 
Planter Kadija’s church and delivering him 
from evil spirits there!

SATURDAY30

Almighty God, bless Adult Literacy student 
Dhara with a child after her many years of 
infertility.

SUNDAY31


